
Higher Plain

AN INTIMATE MOMENT

She sits alone in the dark, in quietness. It's perfect. Her
eyes are closed, her breathing is steady and her mind is
clear of all distraction. She focuses her mind on one line,
“I am a child of the Most High God. I am a child of the
Most High God.” 

She speaks to the Holy Spirit inside of her. 

“Glory to Your name, Lord. Please cleanse me of all my
sins. Cleanse me, Lord.”

“Please fill me, Holy Spirit." 

She then feels His presence. It becomes thicker and
more intense as her awareness of His glory intensifies.
She feels herself being lifted in her spirit, a spiritual,
surreal, almost out-of-body experience she has been
having with Him in these moments as the Holy Spirit
makes Himself known. 

The presence becomes so thick she falls to her knees in
worship. Yielded. It is an intimate time with her God. She
hears Him clearly say “I am with you.” 

She continues to worship, grateful for this time she
shares with her Lord, to commune with Him in a way
that can only happen like this. 
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She asks Him to speak to her as she wants to hear from
Him. 

She receives a vision. It is beautiful. No words this time,
but a clear vision that shows her what He will do
through her to touch the world.

A few minutes pass. She sits and uses her light to write
down the vision she received. She leaves the room
glowing, feeling absolutely empowered, refreshed,
reassured, revived, and emboldened. Her mind is clearer,
her mission even more powerful as she knows what she
must do. 

THIS was the missing power all along! This is what she
had not known all her years as a believer. It was never
taught to her.

---------------

This girl is me. This is the power I experience through
meditation with the Holy Spirit.

Meditation heightens awareness of the presence of a
holy God. When all is stripped away and you go before
your Creator in quiet, there is a beautiful, intimate
experience that cannot be fully described. 
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Spending time with Him in this way brings clarity,
power and transformation. He gives you just what you
need. 

Asking Him specific questions in this time can also
mean specific answers – wisdom for your life, marriage,
vision for your business and purpose. It means receiving
from Wisdom and Peace Himself, that which He has just
for you.

Make the time to meditate with the Holy Spirit. Nothing
else you do can compare with this.


